GIG HARBOR
CITY COUNCIL MEETING

June 26, 1995

7:00 P.M., CITY HALL COUNCIL CHAMBERS






AGENDA FOR GIG HARBOR CITY COUNCIL MEETING
June 26, 1995 - 7:60 p.m,

PUBLIC COMMENT/DISCUSSION:

CALL TO ORDER:

APPROVAL OF MINUTES:

CORRESPONDENCE:
1. Department of the Air Force - McChord.

OLD BUSINESS:
1. Second Reading - Revised Building Code.

NEW BUSINESS:

Reappointment of Teresa Mailich Mueller to the Planning Commission.
Request for Utility Extension - Westside Professional Park.

Professional Services Agreement - Thornton.

Resolution Opposing Acceptance of Spent Nuclear Fuel.

Liquor License Application, Change of Ownership - Down East Restaurant.

bl M

MAYOR'S REPQRT:

COUNCIL COMMENTS:

STAFF REPORTS:

ANNOUNCEMENT OF OTHER MEETINGS:

APPROVAL OF BILLS:

EXECUTIVE SESSION; For the purpose of discussion claims and Initiative 164.

ADJOURN:







REGULAR GIG HARBOR CITY COUNCIL MEETING OF JUNE 12, 1995

PRESENT: Councilmembers Picinich, Platt, Markovich and Mayor Wilbert, Councilman
Ekberg was absent.

PUBLIC COMMENT / DISCUSSION:

Ross Bischoff - 16815 Hoff Road, Lakebay. Mr. Bischoff, General Manager for the Gig Harbor
Farmer’s Market, gave a presentation about the Market’s growth, purpose, and how they operate,
He answered Councilman Picinich’s concerns about the affect on the downtown merchants and
promised to work with the business owners to minimize problems.

Jim Pasin - 2910 39th Street. Mr. Pasin requested that the Fairway Estates development be
included in the proposed annexation of the Westside. He passed out a map of the area and added
that a copy of the letter he presented had been sent to the neighborhood’s homeowners
association, and was being circulated at this time. He said he would continue working with M.
Hoppen on this issue.

Bob Frishie - 9720 Woodworth Ave. Mr. Frishie suggested that Council consider having people
sworn in before presenting testimony before the Council, that it might tend to get people to
consider telling all the truth. His second concern was an article in the paper regarding to
extending utilities outside the city. He added that he was aware the decisions are up to the
Council. He stated that he is proud that the eight years he was on the Council, they were able
to keep the utility rates low due in part to the one and a half times surcharge for outside
extensions, and asked that Council keep looking at the numbers and consider the future.

Wade Perrow - 9119 No. Harborview Drive. Mr. Perrow asked to be brought up to date on the
North Gig Harbor Annexation and how the recent Council decisions regarding utility extensions
may affect the waterline he was installing, extending the city water service from the Women’s
Correction Center to his property on Burnham Drive. He said he was concerned that he is being
required to install a 16" line to serve future service in the area, and asked for direction on
whether he would be able to recoup some of his costs with latecomers fees if others were allowed
an outside extension, or whether he should downsize the line to an 8" line if no extensions were
going to be allowed. Councilman Picinich said he wouldn’t want to say anything until he had
a chance to talk to Ben Yazici and that someone would be contacting Wade.

Jack Bujacich - 3607 Ross Ave. Mr. Bujacich asked for clarification regarding the newspaper
article stating that $100,000 was being spent to upgrade the Harbor Green Park. He wanted to
know what had happened to the committee process, where the money was coming from, and why
so much was being spent on so few people, since the Community Center would not be built there.
Brian Miller, Gateway reporter who wrote the article, said that upon follow-up on the article, he
learned that $100,000 had been budgeted for the project, but not necessarily all of it was going
to be spent. Mr. Hoppen gave an update on the City’s efforts to obtain the Peninsula School
District property, which then could be utilized to build the Community Center adjacent to Harbor
Green Park.

Mr. Bujacich then voiced concerns about the striping on the new road construction. He said that
with the parking stalls and bike lanes, the traffic lanes were so narrow that trucks and buses were




crossing over the white line, making it very dangerous. Ben Yazici said he realized it was tight,
but all the options were considered and given the circumstances, this configuration was the best
choice.

Mr, Bujacich’s stated he was very involved when the City received the grants to install the sewers
and that the grants were not issued just for the City, but for a basin service area. He voiced
concerns that the Council’s decision not to extend services unless an area was annexed, when
there are lines extended elsewhere outside city limits, opened up the city for a liability that would
cost the taxpayers a lot of money. Mayor Wilbert assured Mr. Bujacich that the Council was
indeed doing their homework on this issue,

SWEARING IN CEREMONY;

Judge Tom Farrow presided over the swearing in of Marilyn Owel to Council Position Number
Three, recently vacated by Jeanne Stevens Taylor. After the ceremony, the newly appointed
Councilmember Owel took her seat on the Council.

CALL TO ORDER: 7:35 p.m.

APPROVAL OF MINUTES:

MOTION: Move approval of the minutes of the May 22, 1995 meeting with changes.
Picinich/Platt - unanimously approved.

CORRESPONDENCE:
I Bruce and Linda Dishman - Cruizin' the Gig. Mayor Wilbert introduced this letter thanking

the City for their continued support of the yearly car show. A $200 check was included with
the letter to be donated to the City Park Fund.

2. Kent Wienker, President. Tacoma Wheelmen's Bicycle Club. This letter was to thank the
Mayor and Ben Yazici for their support in helping make the Olympic Interchange safer for

bicyclists in encouraging the WSDOT to modify their design to better accommodate
bicyclists.

3. Pierce County 4-H Guide Puppy Raisers. This letter was to thank the City for the use of City
Hall for the State 4-H Leaders meeting and Fun Day for the Guide Dog Puppy Raisers.

4 Pierce_County Resolution R95-110 - Organizing the Tacoma/Pierce_County Health

Department as the Pierce County Health Department, Mayor Wilbert spoke briefly on this

resolution to facilitate the reorganization of the Health Department.

5. Resolution of the Pierce County Council - Mayor Wilbert gave a report on this resolution
opposing the adoption of a policy being proposed jeintly by the U.S. Department of Energy

and the U.S. Dept. of State to accept and manage spent nuclear fuel from foreign research
reactors by shipment through the Port of Tacoma.

OLD BUSINESS: None.



NEW BUSINESS;

1.

Summer Tennis Program Proposal, Mark Hoppen introduced Doug Clark. Mr. Clark, who
is a long time resident of Gig Harbor and owner of a health club in Fircrest, said that in the
absence of summer programs and the recent failure of the school levy, he was proposing a
program to provide summer activities for the youth in the area and their families. Mr. Clark
assured Councit that no one would be excluded from the program, and that scholarships
would be made available to those unable to pay the minimal fees. He answered questions
regarding liability insurance and signage, Carol Morris, legal counsel, said that the City
should be indemnified in case of injury.

MOTION: Move we allow this program to occur as a public service, and the City Park
should be made available to provide this service,
Markovich/Platt - unanimously approved.

Appointment to the Planning Commission. Mavyor Wilbert announced that she had

appointed Carol Davis to fill the vacant position on the Planning Commission left by
Marilyn Owel. Ray Gilmore informed Ms. Davis that her first meeting was Thursday night.

MOTION: Move approval of the Mayor's appointment of Carol Davis to the vacant
Planning Commission position.
Platt/Picinich - unanimously approved.

f Seceded. Resolutions No. 164 and No, 173, Mark Hoppen introduced this
housekeeping resolution to repeal these resolutions that had been superseded by Ordinance
#660, which was adopted February of 1994.

MOTION: Move adoption of Resolution No. 444,
Markovich/Picinich - unanimously approved.

Resolution - Hearing Examiner Recommendation - Lita Dawn Stanton, Coffee House. Steve
Osguthorpe introduced this resolution requesting site plan approval for a Coffee House
located at 3615 Harborview Drive, and gave a brief overview of the project. Councilman
Markovich recused himself from this agenda item, as the applicant is a relative. Mayor
Wilbert asked if any other Councilmembers had received any exparte oral or written
communications on this matter or if there were any potential appearance of fairness issues.
She added that if any member of the audience had any appearance of fairness challenge for
any Councilmember or the Mayor, that they should make their concerns known at this time.
Councilman Platt, Councilmember Picinich, and Councilmember Owel all stated that they
had received written communication from Bob Frisbie regarding this item, and had read the
information. Mayor Wilbert said she also had received this packet, and ruled that the
information was not a part of the record and should be disregarded in any decisions being
made. No one from the audience responded to the appearance of fairness issue. After
discussion between Councitmembers and staff, the following motions were made.

MOTION: Move to add a section 2. D. to the resolution to read as follows: The parking
agreement shall state that should the use approved subject to Conditional Use
Permit 95-02 cease, the parking agreement between the parties shall

-3-




terminate, and the applicant or its successor in interest shall not have use of
the off-site parking for any other, subsequent application, unless specifically
approved by the City.

QOwel/Picinich - unanimously approved.

MOTION: Move approval of Resolution No. 445 as amended.
Platt/Owel -

Councilmember Owel asked to amend the motion to include labeling for the off-site parking stalls.

AMENDED MOTION: Move to amend the resolution to add a section 2-E to read:
The parking agreement shall state that off-site parking spaces
will be identified as exclusive to the coffee shop pursuant to
‘Conditional Use Permit 95-02,

Owel/Platt - unanimously approved.

5. First Reading -~ Revised Building Code. Steve Bowman presented the first reading of this
ordinance adopting the Washington State Building Codes with State and City revisions. He

gave a brief overview of some of the revisions. This ordinance will return at the next council
meeting for its second reading.

6. Resolution - Amending Fee Schedules. Ray Gilmore introduced this resolution to amend
the fee schedule due to the deletion of radon test kits being issued by the city.

MOTION: Move to amend the fee schedule by adoption of Resolution No. 446,
Markovich/Picinich - unanimously approved.

7. Resolution - Corre Legal Description (ANX91-07 - Gig Harbor Interchange Annex.
Ray Gilmore presented this resolution making two minor corrections to the legal description
recorded with Pierce County in the Tallman Annexation.

MOTION: Move we adopt Resolution No. 447 amending the legal description to
ANX91-07.
Picinich/Markovich - unanimously approved.

8. Liquor License Application - irit Market & Deli. Discussion regarding the close
proximity of this location to the Henderson Bay Alternative School led to the following
motion.

MOTION: Move we recommend denial of this application.
Picinich/Owel - Councilmembers Picinich and Owel voting in favor.
Councilmembers Platt and Markovich voting against. Mayor Wilbert broke
the tie by voting in favor of denying the application,

9. Transfer Application - Kinza Terivaki. No action taken.




10. Liquor License Renewals - Harvester, Puerto Vallarta, and Round Table Pizza. No action

taken.

MAYOR'S REPORT:

Best Management Practice for Hazardous Waste. Mayor Wilbert showed Councilmembers the
BMP Manual, poster, and pamphlets developed to educate marina owners and their tenants
throughout the Puget Sound Area in the handling of waste and hazardous waste. She added that the
marina owners in Gig Harbor had helped in developing the manual, and these materials had been
distributed back to them. She said these educational tools had been funded by a grant awarded to
Puget Soundkeepers Alliance by the Puget Sound Water Quality Authority.

In g Major Earthquake, what do I do about Natural Gas? Mayor Wilbert illustrated how to turn off
a gas meter utilizing the model gas meter provided by Washington Natural Gas, in cooperation with

GHKP Emergency Preparedness Committee, Ace Hardware, and Borgens., The display, available
for citizens to practice shutting off their own gas, will be at City Hall through July.

¢ on Sakhalin Island, Russia, Mayor Wilbert said there was no damage in our Sister City,
but the people there have asked for assistance in developing a children’s hospital. She added that
the third graders Discovery Elementary students had initiated a penny drive, and Key Bank had
donated one thousand penny rollers toward their effort to raise money to share with the children in
Russia. ' :

COUNCIL COMMENTS: None.

STAFK REPORT:

Ben Yazici gave an update on the grant applications. He said that the Judson Street and Harborview
Street End projects had not been accepted, but the Rosedale Street project had cleared the first cut.
He complimented Maureen Whitaker, Public Works Assistant, for her assistance in authoring the
grant applications. He added that the grant was for $500,000, plus an additional $70,000 had been
received from a previous grant. With the matching City funds, the approximate funding for the
project would be $700,000.

Ben reported that the contractors are approximately two weeks ahead of schedule on the North
Harborview Drive Project and the estimated completion date is July 22nd.

ANNOUNCEMENT OF QOTHER MEETINGS:
Farmer's Market Meeting - 8:30 a.m. City Hall, June 13th.

APPROVAL OF BILLS:

MOTION: Move approval of warrants #14236 through #14328 in the amount of
$549,921.41.
Platt/Picinich - unanimously approved.




APPROVAL OF PAYROLL;

MOTION: Move approval of warrants #11190 through #11305 in the amount of
$172,916.76.
Platt/Picinich - unanimously approved.

EXECUTIVE SESSION:

MOTION: Move to adjourn to Executive Session for the purpose of discussing
litigation and possible litigation for approximately 30 minutes.
Picinich/Platt - unanimously approved.

MOTION: Move to return to Regular Session.
Picinich/Platt - unanimously approved.

The Mayor requested Ben Yazici to do a water analysis study between the Correction Center and
the business areas at McCormick Creek and bring back the information to Council.

ADJOURN:

MOTION: Move to adjourn at 9:3¢ p.m.
Platt/Picinich - unanimously approved.

Cassette recorder utilized.

Tape 390 Side A 000 - end.
Tape 390 Side B 000 - end.
Tape 391 Side A 000 - end.
Tape 391 Side B 000 - 306.

Mayor City Administrator



DEPARTMENT OF THE AIR FORCE

HEADQUARTERS 62D AIRLIFT WING (AMC)

Craig P. Rasmussen, Colonel, USAF
Commander, 62d Airlift Wing

100 Main Street STE 1028
McChord AFB WA 98438-1199

The Honorable Gretchen Wilbert
Mayor of Gig Harbor

P.O. Box 145

Gig Harbor WA 98335

 Dear Mayor Withert

As the new Wing Commander for McChord Air Force Base, I am delighted to live
and work in the Puget Sound Region. Brigadier General Marr told me about the
tremendous support McChord receives from its local communities, and I intend to do all I
can to maintain the strong ties that already exist. My first step is to continue the effort
made by Brig Gen Marr to provide you with pericdic updates about McChord.

First, let me assure you that I remain committed to sustaining McChord’s reputation
as one of the Air Force’s premiere installations. With the backing of the Secretary of
Defense and Chief of Staff of the Air Force, we are continuously improving the quatity of
life for personnel on the base. Current construction and renovations will further improve
the living and working conditions here. These are important endeavors because a quality
" environment greatly enhances the overall effectiveness of our personnel.

We continue to see the results of that effectiveness in the many missions McChord
personnel perform, As you know, last year was an extremely busy and challenging time
for our base as we participated in every major world event. We maintain that same level
of effectiveness this year, supporting the efforts in Cuba and Haiti as well as bringing
home the remains of fallen Vietnam heroes.

To maintain our mission readiness, we remain strong in our commitment to training
excellence, Recently, however, public discontent with training neise from both McChord
and Fort Lewis has generated local newspaper coverage and calls to your offices. To help
you better understand the Air Force perspective on this issue; I would like to explain
McChord’s noise abatement policy and procedures.

In awareness of our civilian neighbors, McChord maintains quiet hours from 11:00
p.m. to 6:00 a.m. We do not fly training missions during those hours. The only aircraft
flying are those involved with world events and missions. Unfortunately, many of the

calls we receive here are in relation to aircraft flying during the duty day,
AMC-GLOBAL REacH FOR AMERICA



Most callers simply want us to stop flying over their homes. Due to the development
of the local communities around McChord, it is impossible for us to avoid flying over
residential areas that are within our flight path. That path is established in close
cooperation with the FAA and takes into consideration the volume of air traffic in the
local area.

We instruct our pilots to request air traffic controllers direct them over nonresidential
areas whenever possible. Unfortunately, due to weather and air traffic conditions, Seattle
Approach and McChord tower are not always able to do that. Our concern about the
impact McChord has on the local area is of paramount importance; however, safety must
be our primary concern.

In addition to our guiet hours, we maintain a log of concern calls and brief our pilats
and air traffic controllers on the amount and locations of these calls. We wili continue to
monitor noise complaint trends and do all we can to ensure an equitable balance between
our noise abatement efforts and our training requirements.

Finally, there are two events taking place this summer that I am sure will be of
interest. The first is our airshow which takes place July 8th. This gives us the
opportunity to showcase McChord to the thousands of people who come to our base.
They will see first-hand the quality people who make up today’s Air Force. On the
evening of July 7th, we will host a salute to our veterans in conjunction with our hangar
party. The theme for the hangar party is Victory in World War II, and we will take this
opportunity to salute our local veterans from World War II and all wars. I extend an
invitation to you to be a part of this event which begins at 5:00 p.m. on the 7th. Please
RSVP to Mrs. Eileen Scott at 984-5637 or feel free to call if you have any questions.
However, if you are unable to join us on the 7th, I hope you will come to the base on the
8th and enjoy Airshow ‘95.

Our second event will take place in August when the 62 Airlift Wing and the 446
Airlift Wing Reserve undergo an Operational Readiness Inspection. Again, we will have
the opportunity to display the commitment and professionalism that have made McChord
an award-winning installation.

As we have all come to realize, military installations do not operate in a vacuum.
Their success and existence rely heavily upon the support they receive from their
communities. 1 look forward to working with you to further the strong relationships that
exist between our communities and ensuring that both grow and prosper well into the
next century.

Sincerely

CRAIG P. RASMUSSEN, Colonel, USAF
Commander



City of Gig Harbor. The “Maritime City.”

3105 JUDSON STREET
GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON 98335
(206) 851-8136
TO: MAYOR WILBERT AND CITY COUNCIL
FROM: STEVE BOWMAN, BUILDING OFFICIAL/FIRE MARSHAL
DATE: JUNE 21, 1995
SUBJECT: ADOPTION OF THE WA. STATE BUILDING CODES WITH STATE
AND CITY REVISIONS

INTRODUCTION:

The Washington State Legisiature has delegated the responsibility for revising the State Building
Codes to the Building Code Council (BCC). Revisions to the State Building Codes were
adopted by the BCC on November 18, 1994 with an effective date set for June 30, 1995.
Summaries of the proposed amendments are attached. Complete copies of the Uniform Codes
and their revisions are available for review in the Gig Harbor Department of Planning and
Building.

POLICY ISSUES:

Attached for your consideration is an ordinance, for adoption by reference, of the BCC revisions.
Included are revisions to the Uniform Building, Fire, Plumbing, Mechanical, Barrier Free, and
Energy Codes, and the Water Conservation Performance Standards. The Washington State
Building Code Council has prepared small business economic impact statements under Chapter
19.85 RCW for the State adoption of the Uniform Codes and the WA State amendments.

Other revisions are editorial to remove references to previous code editions which are no longer

City or State codes. Chapter 15.20 (Gasoline Service Stations) appropriate sections are now in

the Zoning Code; Chapter 15.24 (Television & Radio Antennas) enforced by the City Clerk; and
15.28 (Security Devices) enforced by the Police Department are proposed to be repealed.

The Washington State BCC has amended the 1994 UBC to provide a different rise/run standard
for stairways. The Washington Association of Building Officials has recommended that all
jurisdictions within the State not adopt the revision because it is a reduction in the minimum
standards which have been proven to provide a safer means of egress for people.

The draft ordinance before you would approve the WA State revision to the 1994 UBC as
recommended by the City of Gig Harbor Building Code Advisory Board. The Gig Harbor
Building Code Advisory Board recommended approval of the proposed ordinance during their
meeting on June 1, 1995. The City of Gig Harbor Building Code Advisory Board is concerned
that the City of Gig Harbor have standards that are uniform with the standards enforced in the
jurisdictions surrounding the City of Gig Harbor. '

Radon test kits will no longer be provided by the City of Gig Harbor for new dwellings. A
resolution is also attached which would revise the fee schedule to no longer require building
permit (for new dwellings) applicants to pay a $15.00 radon test kit fee.




The City Attorney has reviewed this draft of the adopting ordinance and has submitted
comments for consideration prior to this second reading. Additionally, the Public Works
Department is working with Planning-Building in developing some modifications to the revised
code. These updates will be presented to the Council in August.

RECOMMENDATION:

The Mayor and City Council adopt the 1994 Uniform Building Codes with the revisions as
adopted by the Washington State Building Code Council and as recommmended by the Gig Harbor
Building Code Advisory Board, and further amended to require stairways to have a rise/run in
accordance with the following GHMC Section # 15.06.090, after the second reading of the
ordinance and inclusion of any required revisions.

FAUSERSSTEVEORD-RESWCCMO242.UBC



CITY OF GIG HARBOR
ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON, ADOPTING THE
WASHINGTON STATE BUILDING CODE, including the 1994 editions to the Uniform
Building Code, Uniform Fire Code, Uniform Mechanical Code, the Washington
Administrative Code amendments to these 1994 Uniform Codes as well as the WAC
amendments to the 1991 Uniform Plumbing Codes, certain code standards and lecal
amendments; repealing chapters 15.06, 15.08, 15.10, 15,12, 15.20, 15.24, 15,28 and 15.36,
and adding new chapters 15.06, 15.10, 15.12 and 15.36 to the Gig Barbor Municipal Code.

WHEREAS, the Washington State chislature has adopted the 1994 editions to the Uniform
Building, Fire and Mechanical Codes, together with certain Washington Administrative Code
("WAC™") amendments and uniform code standards; and,

WHEREAS, the State also adopted new WAC amendments to the 1991 Uniform Plumbing
Code; and

WHEREAS, the Cades as amended will become effectwe in all cities and countles in the State
of Washmgton on: June 30, 1995; and . _ :

WHEREAS, the Gig Harbor Municipal Code must be amended to reﬂect the adoption of the
new regulations; and,

WHEREAS, Title 15 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code contains regnlations which are either
outdated or duplicative of other sections in the City’s Zoning Code (chapters 15.20, 15.24,
15.28) and should therefore be repealed; and ‘ _ '

WHEREAS, the Gig Harbor City Council finds that the adoption of the 1994 Uniform Building
Codes with certain Washington State Building Code amendments is in the public interest.

NOW, THEREFQRE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR,
WASHINGTON, ORDAINS AS FOLLOWS:

Sectign 1. Chapter 15,06 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

Section 2. A new chapter 15.06 is hereby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal
Code, to read as follows:

CAM104800. 1 SX/RHKE. 90000 -1-




Chapter 15.06
UNIFORM BUILDING CODE

Sections:
15.06.010  Uniform Building Code adopted. :
15.06.020  Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings aclopted.
15.06.030  Historic Building Code adopted.
15.06.040  Appeals - Hearing examiner/building code advisory board.
15.06.050  Complete Permit Application.
15.06.060  Expiration.
15.06.070  Permit fees.
15.06.080  Amendment to Section 310,10, Uniform Building Code.
15.06.090  Amendment to Section 904.2.8, Uniform Building Code.
15.06.100 Amendment to Section 1006.3, Uniform Building Code.

15.06.010 Uniform Building Code Adopted. The Uniform Building Code, 1994 Edition,
including Appendix Chapters 15 and 33, and the Uniform Building Code Standards, 1994
Edition, published by the International Conference of Building Officials, and as amended by the
State of Washington as Chapter 51-30 Washington Administrative Code, are adopted for use
within the City of Gig Harbor.

15.06.020 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings Adopted. The Uniform
Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1994 Edition, published by the Internatienal
Conference of Building Officials, is adopted for use within the City of Gig Harbor.

15.06.030  Historic Building Code Adopted. The Historic Building Code, Chapter 51-19
WAC, is adopted for use within the City of Gig Harbor.

15.06.040  Amendment to Section 105.1, Uniform Building Code. Section 105.1 of the
Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

CAM104800. 15X/P0008.90000 -2-



15.06.050  Amendment to Section 106.3.1, Uniform Building Code, Section
106.3.1 of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows: '

106.3.1 Application.

A, To obtain a permit, the applicant shall first file an application
therefor in writing on a form furnished by the eede—eﬂiefeemeﬁt

L.

Jpmeeamnne

Identify and describe the work to be covered by the permit
for which application is made;

Describe the land on which the pr0p9§§_q_
done by legal description, street address; Sk Rare
or similar description that will rcadlly 1dent1fy and

definitely locate the proposed building or work;

Indicate the use or occupancy for which the proposed work
is intended;

Be accbmpanied by plans, diagrams, Cotﬁputations and

specifications and other data as required in Section 106.3.2;

State the valuation of any new building or structure or any
addition, remodeling or alteration to an existing building;

Be signed by the applicant, or the applicant’s authorized
agent;

CAMI04800, 15X /P00DE, 90000




15.06.050. Amendment to Section 106.4.4, Uniform Building Code. Section
106.4.4 of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

106.4.4 Expiration.

Al Every permit issued by the building official under the provisions
of thls code shall explre by hm]tatlon and become null and void if:

CAMI04800. 1 5X/PODOS, 90000 -4 -



commenced within 180 days from the date of such permit; {3]
building or work authorized by such permit is suspended or
abandoned at any tune after the w k1

- 15 of such oy Before such work can be
recommenced a new permlt shall be first obtained to do 50, and
the fee therefor shall be one half the amount required for a new
permit for such work, provided no changes have been made or will

e made in the ongmal plans and spemﬁcanpns

g e L i i

for such work gg@
AIHIRE S

susp nsmn

B. Any permittee holding an unexpired permit may apply for an
extension of the time within which he may commence work under
that permit when he is unable to commence work within the time
required by this section for good and satisfactory reasons. The
building official may extend the time for action by the permittee
for a period not exceeding 180 days upon written request by the
permittee showing that circumstances beyond the control of the
permittee have prevented action from being taken. No permit shall
be extended more than once. In order to renew action on a permit
after expiration, the permittee shall pay a new full permit fee.

15.06.060 Amendment to Section 107.2, Uniform Building Code.
Section 107.2 of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows;

107.2 Permit Fees.

A, A fee for each permit shall be pald to the City of Gig Harbor m
the amount set forth in ey -

B. The detcmunatlon of value or valuation under any of the provisions of thxs
code shall be made by the building official, wial SRAE

tbe blnldlg permit and building plan review fees shall be the total value

CAMI04800. 1SX/RO008, 90000 -5-




of all construction work for which the permit is issued, as well as all
finish work, painting, roofing, -electrical,plumbing, heating, air
conditioning, elevators, fire-extinguishing systems and any other
permanent equipment.

15.06.070 Amendment to Section 310.10, Uniform Building Code. Section
310.10 of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

310.10 Fire Alarm Systems.

A,

CAM104800. 15X/POGOE. 20000

Group R, Division 1 Occupancies shall be provided with an
approved manual and automatlc f" ire alarm systern _m_apartment

-‘i?gﬁ;i.: w w‘?@!s Viiich containg sk

@ Or more guest rooms and in congregate residences three or

more stories in height or havmg an occupant load =f 20 or more

£ e, A fire alarm and

commumcatlon system shall be prowdcd in Group R, Division 1
Occupancies located in a high-rise building,

EXCEPTIONS:

1. A manual fire alarm system need not be vravided in
buildings not over two stories in height when all individual
dwelling units and contiguous attic and crawl spaces are
separated from each other and public or common areas by
at least one-hour fire-resistive occupancy separations and
each individual dwellmg unit or guest room has an ex1t

2. A separate fire alarm system need not be provided in
bulldmgs which are protected throughout by an approved

And hmé  Tocal alarm to

nonfy all occupants

The alarm signal shall be a distinctive sound which is not used for
any other purpose other than the fire alarm. Alarm-signaling
devices shall produce a sound that exceeds the prevailing
equivalent sound level in the room or space by 15 decibels
minimum, or exceeds any maximum sound level with a duration
of 30 seconds minimum by 5 decibels minimum,

-6-



whichever is louder. Sound levels for alarm signals shall be 120
decibels maximum. '

C. For the purposes of this section, area separation walls shall not
define separate buildings. '

15.06.080¢  Amendment to Section 904.2.8, Uniform Building Code. Section
904.2.8 of the Uniform Building Code is amended as follows:

904.2.8 Group R Division 1 Occupancies. An automatic sprmklcr

W %‘M stories in helght “or

contammg 16 5: or more dwellmg units, every congregate residence three
or more stories in hezght or havmg an occupant load of 29—6f more £

bt v

{ ) > = /g, 3
standard sprmklers "shall be used in the dwelling units and guest room
portlons of the building.

15.06.090 Amendment to Section 1006.3, Uniform Building Code. Section
1006.3 of the Uniform Building Code, is amended as follows:

1006.3 Rise and Run.

A.  The rise of steps shall not be 1es_s than 4 inches (102 mm) or
greater than—?—%é—raehes{}%ﬂmm}

than-l-@-—lﬂehﬁ—eéél—mm}ﬁ:

horizontally between the vertical planes of the furthermost
projections of adjacent treads. Except as permitted in Section
1006.4, 1006.5 and 1006.6, the largest tread run within any flight
of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (5.5
mm). The greatest riser height within any flight of stairs shall not

exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (5.5 mm).

EXCEPTIONS:

CAMI04800. 15X/FO008. 50000 «7 -




1. Private steps and stairways serving an occupant load of less
than 10 and stairways to unoccupied roofs may be
constructed with an 8-inch-maximum (203 mm) rise and a
9-inch-minimum (229 mm) run.

2. Where the bottom or top riser adjoins a sloping public way,
walk or driveway having an established grade and serving
as a landing, the bottom or top riser may be reduced along
the slope.

B. Where Exception 2 to Section 1103.2.2 is used in a building
design, the run of stair treads shall not be less than 11 inches (279
mm), as measured horizontally between the vertica! planes of the
furthermost projections of adjacent fread. The largest tread
within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more
than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm).

Section 3. Chapter 15.08 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

Section 4. A new chapter 15.08 is hereby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal

Code, to read as follows:

Chapter 15.08
UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE

Sections:
15.08.010  Provisions adopted.
15.08.020  Permit fees.
15.08.030  Appeals - Hearing examiner/building code advisory board.

15.08.040  Expiration.

15.08.010 Provisions Adopted. The Uniform Plumbing Code, 1991 Edition,
including Appendix Chapters A, B, D and H, and the Uniform Plumbing Code
Standards, published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials and as amended by the State of Washington as Chapters 51-26 and 51-27
WAC (including the State of Washington Water Conservation Performance
Standards) are adopted for use within the city of Gig Harbor.

CAM104300, 1SX/R0004, 950000 -8-



15.08.020 Amendment to Section 30.3 (d), Uniform Plumbing Code.
Section 30.3 (d) of the Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as follows:

30.3 (d) Expnratmn. Every permit issued by the Administrative
Authority BUildifig OFNEIAl under the provnsmns of this code shall expire -
by hmltatlon and become null and void §§ Boder At

recommenced a new: permlt shall bc first obtamed to do so, and the fee
therefor shall be one half the amount required for a new permit for such
work provided no changes have been made or will be made in the

Any permittee holding and unexpired permit may apply for an
extension of the time within which he may commence work under that
permit when he is unable to commence work within the time required by
this section for good and satisfactory reasons. The building official may
extend the time for action by the permittee for a period not exceeding 180
days upon wriiten request by the permittee showing that circumstances
beyond the control of the permittee have prevented action from being
taken. No permit shall be extended more than once. In order to renew
action on a permit after expiration, the permittee shall pay a new full
permit fee.

15.08.030 Amendment to Section 30.4 (a), Uniform Plumbing Code.
Section 30.4 (a), Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as follows:

30.4 (a} Perpnt Fees. The fee for each permit shai[ be as set forth m

15.08.040 Amendment to Section 2¢1 to the Uniform Plumbing Code.
Section 201 of the Uniform Plumbing Code is amended as foilows:

CAMI04800, 1 SX/FO00S. 90000 -9.




Sectlon 201 (1)

Section 5. Chapter 15.10 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Cod's is hereby repealed.

Section 6. A new chapter 15.10 is hereby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal
Code, to read as follows:

- Chapter 15.10 :
UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE

Sections:
15.10.010  Provisions adopted.
15.06.020  Permit fees.
15.10.030  Appeals - Hearing examiner/building code advisory board.

15.10.040  Expiration.

15.10.015 Provisions adopted. The Uniform Mechanical Code, 1994 Edition,
including Chapter 13, Fuel Gas Piping, Appendix B, pubhshed by the
International Conference of Bmldmg Officials, as @ . q
Washington {#i Chapter 51-32 WAC, is adopted for use within the City of Gig
Harbor,

15.10.020 Amendment to Section 110.1, Uniform Mechanical Code. Section
110.1 of the Uniform Mechanical Code is amended as follows:

Section 110,1 - BOARD OF APPEALS,

CAM104800. 1SX/PO00S.90000 -10 -



15.10.030 Amendment to Section 114.4.1, Uniform Mechanical Code.
Section 114.4.1 of the Uniform Mechanical Code is amended as follows:

114.4.1 Expiration. Every permit issued by the building official under
the provnslons of thls code shall expire by limitation and bezome null and
id § ¢ e following crpum ﬁiﬁ’*ﬁ"’w&f 3 if the work authorized

can be recommenced 2 new permlt shall be first obt;nned to do so, and
the fee therefor shall be one half the amount required for a new permit for
such work, provided no changes have been made or will be made in the

orlgmal plans and spec1ﬂcat10ns for such work s

R ST IR Rt L sms by e
= L et 3

- e

prowded further than such suspenswn abandonment ha has not exceeded one
year. No permit shall be extended more than once. In order to renew
action on a permit after expiration, the permittee shall pay a new full

permit fee.

15.10.040 Amendment to Section 115.2, Uniformmn Mechanical Ceode.
Section 115.2, Uniform Mechanical Code is amended as follows:

115.2 Permit Fees. The fee for each permlt shall be as set forth in

Tablc 3-A Afes
<

Section 7. Chapter 15.12 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.

CAM104£00. 15X /RO00S. 50000 -« 11 -




Section 8. A new chapter 15.12 is hereby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal

Sections:

15.12.010
15.12.020
15.12.030
15.12.040
15.12.050
15.12.060
15.12.070
15.12.080
15.12.090
15.12.100

15.12.110
15.12.120
15.12.130
15.12.140
15.12.150
15.12.160
15.12.170
15.12.180

15.12.015

Code, to read as follows:

Chapter 15.12
UNIFORM FIRE CODE

Provisions adopted.

Amendment to Section 103.1.4, Appeals.

Amendment to Section 104.2, Investigations.

Amendment to Article 2, Definitions.

Amendment 1o Section 901.4, Fire apparatus access.

Amendment to Section 02.2.2.1, Fire apparatus access dimensions.
Amendment to Section 902.2.2.3, Turning Radius

Amendment to Section 503.3, Type of water supply.

Amendment to Section 903.4.2, Required installaticns.

Amendment to Sections 1003.2.8, Fire sprinkler systems, Group R,
Division 1.

Amendment to Section 1007.2.9.1.1, Fire Alarm Systems.
Establishment of limited in districts for storage of compressed natural gas.
Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of exploswes and

blasting agents is to be prohibited:

Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of ﬂammabl# or
combustible liquids in outside aboveground tanks is to be prohibited.
Establishment of limits in which bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gas
is to be restricted.

Amendments fo Section 8504, Abatement of Electrical Hazards.
Amendments to Appendix III-C, Testing Personnel

Amendment to Section 6.3, Appendix II-C, Pier Fire Flow.

Provisions adopted. The Uniform Fire Code, 1594 Edition,

including Appendix Chapters I-A, II-C, II-E, II-F, III-A, III-B, III-C, V-A and
VI-A, and the Uniform Fire Code Standards, published by the International
Conference of Building Officials and the Western Fire Chiefs’ Association, as
amended by the State of Washington in Chapter 51-34 of the WAC, with the
exception of WAC 51-34-0902 and 51-34-1003.2.8, are adOpted for use within
the City of Gig Harbor.

15.12.020

Section

Amendment to Section 103.1.4, Uniform Fire Code.

103.1.4 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

CAM104800.18X/P0008. 90000



15.12.030  Amendment to Section 104.2, Uniform Fire Code. Section 104.2
of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

&B%hefwed—te-m’%esﬂgﬂfe-pfempﬂy—the cause, orlgm and bncumstances of
each and every fire occurring in the jurisdiction involving loss of life or
injury to person or destructlon or darnage to property and if it appears to

tie:  aFe authorized to
take immediate charge of all physical evidence relating to the cause of the
fire and ﬁﬁe authorized to pursue the investigation to its conclusion,

a. . The chief is authorized to investigate the cause, origin and .
circumstances of unauthorized releases of hazardous
materials.

b. The Fire Marshal is authorized o investigate promptly the
cause, origin and circumstances of each and every fire
occurring within the City of Gig Harbor boundaries and
involving loss of life or injury to persons or destruction to
or damage of property. If the Fire Marshal has reasonable
cause to believe that arson or criminal activity is connected
with the fire, then the Fire Marshal will report his findings
to the Gig Harbor Police Department. The Fire Marshal
shall assist the Gig Harbor Police Department throughout
the investigation.

CAM104800. 15X /FO00S.00000 - 13 -




o
-

:

S

15.12.040 Amendment to Article 2, Uniform Fire Code. Section Article -

2 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

The following are additional definitions and abbreviations to those found
in Article 2 of the Uniform Fire Code:

CAMINS00, LEX/ROI0S.50000 -14 -

. e vpm



CAMIG4800. 15X /PO00E.00000

"Fire Department” 1s a regularly organized fire department, fire -
protection district or fire company regularly charged with the
ibility of fp owdmg flrc? protectlon to the__Jurlsdlcnon

iRl

Faly halan

SRS et b o]

- 15 -




15.12.050  Amendment to Section 901.4.2, Uniform Fire Code. Section
001.4.2 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

901.4.2 Fire apparatus access roads.

"When required by the ehiefy Git . :
other approved notices shall be provided and mamtamed for fire
apparatus access roads to identify such roads and prohibit the
obstruction thereof or both.

CAM104800.1SX/F0008. 90000 -16 -



15.12.060 Amendment fo Section 902.2.2.1, Uniform Fire Code. Section
902.2.2.1 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

“less than 20 feet (6096 mm) and an unobstructed vertical clearance
of not less than 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm).

CAM104800, 15X/B000S.90000 - 17 -

i g Ry o e ere e N s Toiioun =




15.12.070 Amendment to Section 902.2.2.3, Uniform Fire Code. Section
602.2.2.3 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

902.2.2.3 Turning Radius. The turning radius of z fire _apparatus access
road shall be as approved by the ehief é}‘t : Tt
' i

15.12.080  Amendment to Section 903.3, Uniform Fire Code. Section 903.3

‘of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

903.3 Type of Water Supply. - N

2 Water supply is allowed to consist of reservoirs, pressure tanks,
elevated tanks, water mains or other fixed systems capable of
prov;dmg the reqmred ﬁre ﬂow In setting the requirements for

CAM104800, 1 SX/FO008. 50000 - 18-



CAM104800.153X/10008.90000 - 19 -




CAMIOAB00. F 5X/PO00OE. 0000

- e R b g



CAMI04800, 15X/FO00S. 50000 -21 -




CAM104800. 15X/F0008. 50000 -22 .



CAMI104800.1SXIR0003.90000 -23 -

St WY gmamar g G m—ogegen g g iy e R




CAMI104800. 15K/FO008. 90000




CAM104800, 153/F0008.50000




CAM104800.18X/F0008.50000 - 26 -



CAM104800, 15X/BO008.50000 - 27 -



MY o racictiog nnnnir:)q&ieﬁ
l}' & AL W T LILE T b b LI

A Tcrey

(l} L

N has—ornn aa‘pﬁaﬁeﬂ_ms
U ourTaroir ot

CAM 104800, 15X/PD008. 50000




15.12.090 Amendment to Section 203.4.2, Uniform Fire Code. Section 903.4.2
of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

903.4.2 Required installations.

he location, number and type of fire hydrants connected to a water
supply capable of delivering the required fire flow shall be provided on
the public street or on the site of the premises or both to be protected as
uired and approved by the ehief S
Dend; ed by

CAM104800, LSX/FO008.9000¢ -20_




-0¢ - 00006"S000/XS T"008HOTINV D

I i e
3 \ﬁ;i ‘

AL FLa

ot e P - T



CAMI64800,15X/F0008. 90000 - 31 -



mbre g e

15.12.100 Amendment to Section 1003.2.8, Uniform Fire Code. Section 1003.2.8
of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

Section 1003.2.8. Group R, Division 1 Occupancies.

CAMI04500. 1SX/FO00S. SO000 -32-



RS

An automatic sprinkler system shall be 1nstalled throughout every

qu1ck-response standa
and guest room pomons of the bu1lchng

CAM104800, 15X/FOD08.90000 -33-




s e

15.12.110 Amepdment to Section 1007.2.9.1.1, Uniform Fire Code. Section
1007.2.9.1.1 of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

Section 1007.2.9.1.1. General. Group R Occupancies shall be provided with
fire alarm systems in accordance with Section 1007.2.9. Group R, Division 1
Occupancies shall be provided with 2 rnanual and automatlc f“ ire alarm system in

eﬁﬁE&tﬂ-lﬂ-g—Eg or more gues rooms and in concregate residences three or more
stories in helght or havmg an occupant Ioacl of 20 or more. See aJso Sectlon

Rt SW' fk W‘W’{WW h.\-‘W}}‘ AT

chwmuw‘ik

EXCEPTIONS:

i. A manual fire alarm system need not be provided in buildings not
over two stories in height when all individual dwelling units and
contiguous attic and crawl spaces are separated from each other
and public or common areas by at least one-hour fire-resistive
occupancy separations and each individual dwelling unit or guest
room has an exit directly to a pubhc way, exit court or yard;

m-"'

2. A separate fire alarm system need not be provided in buildings
which are protected throughout by an approved supsrvmed fire
sprmklc_:; system

CAMI104800. 1SX/POD08 50000 - 34 -



15.12.120 Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of compressed natural
gas is to be prohibited. The limits referred to in Section 5204.5.2 of the Uniform Fire
Code, in which storage of compressed natural gas is prohibited, are established and shall
apply to all areas in which the Uniform Fire Code is in force; provided, however, that
the office of the fire marshal may issue a special permit for such storage, where there
appears in its judgment to be no undue danger to persons or property and where such
storage would not be in conflict with other city codes.

15.12.130 Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of explosives and
blasting agents is to be prohibited. The limits refecred to in Section 7701.7.2 of the
Uniform Fire Code, in which storage of explosives and blasting agents is prohibited, are
established and shall apply to all areas in which the Uniform Fire Code is in force;
provided, however, that the office of the fire marshal may issue a special permit for such

CAM104800. 1 SX/FO008, 50000 -35.




storage, where there appears in its judgment to be no undue danger to persons or
property and where such storage would not be in conflict with other city codes.

15.12.140 Establishment of limits of districts in which storage of flammable or
combustible liquids in outside aboveground tanks is to be prohibited. The limits
referred to n Section 7902.2.2.1 and 7904.2.5.4.2 of the Uniform Fire Code, in which
storage of flammable or combustible liquids is restricted are hereby established and shall
apply to all areas in which the Uniform Fire Code is in force; provided, however, that
the office of the fire marshal may issue a special permit for such storage, where there
appears in its judgment to be no undue danger to persons or property and where such
storage would not be in conflict with other city codes.

15.12.150 Establishiment of limits in which bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gas
is to be restricted. The limits referred to in Section §204.2 of the Uniform Fire Code,
in which bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted, are hereby established and
shall apply to all areas in which the Uniform Fire Code is in force; provided, however,
that the office of the fire marshal may issue a special permit for such storage, where
there appears in its judgment to be no undue danger to persons or property and where
such storage would not be in conflict with other Gig Harbor city codes.

15.12.160 Amendment to Section 8304, Uniform Fire Code. Section 8504 of the Uniform
Fire Code is amended as follows:

Section 8504 - Abatement of Electrical Hazards. When electrical hazards are
identified, measures to abate such conditions shall be taken. Identified hazardous
electncal cond1t10ns in permanent wmng or temporary wlrm correctcd in cooperatlon

Electrical wiring, devices, appliances and other equipment which are modified or
damaged and constitute an electrical shock or fire hazard shall not be used.

CAMI04800. 1SX/FO008, 90000 - 36 -



15.12.170 Amendment te Section 1.2, Appendix II-C, Uniform Fire Code.
Section 1.2, Appendix III-C of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

1.2 Testing Personnel. The tests established by Appendix III-C shall be
conducted by a person qualified to perform the full testmg procedure for the
partlcular system or device being tested. $He pWter sha :

15.12.180 Amendments to Section 6.3, Appendix II-C Uniform Fire Code.
Section 6.3, Appendix II-C of the Uniform Fire Code is amended as follows:

6.3 Access and Water Supply. Piers and wharves shall be provided with fire
apparatus access roads and water-supply systems with on-site fire hydrants when
required by the chief. Such roads and water systems shall be provided and
mamtamcd in accordance with Sectlons 902 2 and 903 i

[See printed ccpy of Appendlx A Sectlon #15.12.090; fi g 15.12.090 attached]

Section 9. Chapter 15 20 of thc Gig Harbor Mumc1pal Code is hercby repcaled
Section 10. Chapter 15.24 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.
Section 11. Chapter 15.28 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.
Section 12. Chapter 15.36 of the Gig Harbor Municipal Code is hereby repealed.
Section 13. A new chapter 15.36 is hcreby added to the Gig Harbor Municipal Ccde,

to read as follows:

Chapter 15.36
MOVEMENT OF BUILDINGS

Sections:
15.36.010  Definitions.
15.36.020  Permit - Required.
15.36.030  Permit - Application.
15.36.040  Application - Fee.

CAMI04800. 1SX/F0008.50000 -37 -



15.36.050

Application - Insurance.

15.36.060  Application - Deposit for expenses.
15.36.070  Application - Cash deposit or surety bond.
15.36.080  Permit - Denial,

15.36.090  Appeal procedure.

15.36.100  Duties of permittee.

15.36.110  Fees and deposits.

15.36.120  Moving route designated.

15.36.130  Inspection.

15.36.140  Enforcement.

15.36.150  Violation - Penalty.

15.36.010 Definitions. For the purpose of this chapter the following terms, phrases,
words, and their derivations shall have the meaning given in this section:

A, “Building" means a structure as defined in the Uniform Building Code.

B. "Building inspector” means the person appointed as the building official/fire
marshal for the city of Gig Harbor, or his/her designee.

15.36.020 Permit - Required. No person, corporation, firm or organization shall move
~ any building over along or across any public highway, street, or alley in the city without
first obtaining a permit from the City., : :

15.36.030  Permit - Application. A person seeking a permit under this chapter shall
file an application with the city Planning and Building Department upon forms provided
by the city. The application shall set forth:

A. A description of the building(s) to be moved, including dimensions and condition
of exterior and interior;

B. A legal description of the lot from which the building is to be moved, if located

in the city;

C. A legal description of the lot to which the building is to be moved, if located in
the city;

D. The route over which the building is to be moved;

E. Proposed moving date and hours;

F. Any additional information required by the building inspector or the chief of
police.

_ 38 -

CAM104500,1SX/FOO0E. 90000



15.36.040 Application - Fee. Application for a permit shall be accompanied by a fee
of $20.00 for each building proposed to be moved. Such fee shall be determined by the
Council pursuant to Chapter 3.40 GHMC.,

15.36.050 Application - Insurance. The applicant shall show proof of liability
insurance in an amount determined by the public works director, based upon the
estimated property damage and liability risk. A copy of an insurance certificate shall be
filed with the application and shall name the city of Gig Harbor as an additional named
insured. The City reserves the right to require a complete copy of the insurance policy.

15.36.060 Application - Deposit for expenses. Upon receipt of an application, the
Public Works Director shall estimate the expense to remove and replace any city property
to accommodate the moving of a building(s). Prior to the issuance of a permit, the Public
Works Director shall require the applicant to deposit a sum of money equal to twice the
estimated expense.

15.36,100  Daties of permittee. The holder of a building moving permit(s) shall:

A. Use Designated Streets. Move 2 building only over streets designated for such
use in the written permit;

B. Notification of Revised Moving Time. Notify the building inspector in writing of
a desired change in moving date and hours as proposed in the application:

C. Notification of Damage. Nofify the b.uiidin'g ins'pectér in writing of any and all
damage done to property belonging to the City or other property within 24 hours
after the damage or injury has occurred;

- D. Display Lights. Cause red lights to be displayed during the nighttime on every
side of the building, while standing on a street, in such manner as to warn the
public of the obstruction, and shall at all times erect and maintain barricades
across the streets in such manner as to protect the public from damage or injury
by reason of the removal of the building;

E. Street Occupancy Period. Remove the building from the city streets after 24 hours
of such occupancy, unless an extension is granted by the building inspector;

F. Comply with Governing Law. Within six months from the date of issvance of
the permit, comply with the city building, fire and zoning codes, and all other
applicable ordinances and laws upon relocating the building in the city including
the building and electrical code requirements as set forth in RCW 19.27.180;

CAM104800. 18X/F0008.90000 -39 -

s ey B G T e e s e P e ewieoe it oz ges. P e s Lo e e mn e




Pay Expense of Officer. Pay the expense of a traffic officer ordered by the
building inspector to accompany the movement of the building to protect the
public from injury;

Clear Old Premises. If the original building site was located within the City of
Gig Harbor, the applicant shall remove all rubbish and materials and fill all
excavations to existing grade at the original building site so that the premises are
left in a safe and sanitary condition;

Notify Utility and Transportation Companies. Notify each utility or public
transportation company of any of its property that may be encountered in the
moving route,

15.36.110 Fees and deposits.

A.

Return upon Non-issuance. Upon the refusal of the building inspector to issue a -
permit, the Public Works Director shall return to the applicant all deposits and
bonds, but the permit fee shall be non-refundable,

Return upon Allowance for Expense. After the building has been removed, the
Public Works Director shall prepare a written statement of all expenses incurred
in removing and replacing all property belonging to the city, and all material used
in the making of the removal and replacement together with a statement of all
damage caused to or inflicted upon property belonging to the City. The Public
Works Director shall return to the applicant all deposits after deduction of a sum
sufficient to pay for all of the cost and expenses and for all damage done to
property of the city by reason of the removal of the building.

15.36.120 Moving route designated. The building inspector shall designate the streets
over which the building may be moved. The building inspector shall have the list
approved by the police department. In making their determinations, the building inspector
and the police department shatl act to assure maximum safety to persons and property in
the city and to minimize congestion and traffic hazards on public streets.

15.36.130 Inspection. The building inspector shall inspect the building(s) and the
applicant’s equipment to determine if the standards for issuance are met.

15.36.140 Enforcement.

A.

Enforcing Officers. The public works director, building official/fire marshal and
the police department shall enforce and carry out the requirements of this chapter.

Permittee Liable for Expense Above Deposit. The permittee shall be liable for
any expense, damages or costs in excess of deposited amounts or securities, and

CAM104800.1SX/FO008. 90000 - 40 -



the city attorney shall prosecute an action against the permittee in a court
of competent jurisdiction for the recovery of such excessive amounts,

C. Original Premises Left Unsafe. If the original building site was located within the
City of Gig Harbor, and the property has been left in an unsafe condition, the
City shall notify the property owner and require abatement or restoration to a safe
condition. If the property owner fails to take such action, the City may proceed
to do the work necessary to leaving the original premises in a safe and sanitary
condition, and the cost thereof shall be charged against the generat deposit.

15.36,080  Permit - Denial. The building official/fire marshal shall deny a permit

if:

A. Any application requirement or any fee or deposit requirement has not been
complied with;

B. The building is too large to move without endangering persons or property in the
city;

C. The building is in such a state of deterioration or disrepair or is otherwise so

structurally unsafe that it could not be moved without endangering persons and
property in the city;

D.  The building is structurally unsafe or unfit for the purpose for whlch moved if -
- the removal location is in the city;

E. The applicant’s equipment is unsafe and that persons and property would be
endangered by its use;

F. Zoning Code or other ordinances would be violated by the building in its new
location.

15.36.090  Appeal procedure. An applicant may appeal to the city hearing examiner
by filing a written notice of appeal in accordance with Section #15.06.030 of the Gig
Harbor Municipal Code with the Building Official/Fire Marshal within 10 days following
notice from the Building Official/Fire Marshal.

15.36.150  Violation - Penalty. Violation of any portion of this chapter except
section 15.36.040 is an infraction and subject to a penalty of $1,000 as provided in
GHMC 1.16.010D.

Section_14. Severability. If any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance
should be held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such invalidity or
unconstitutionality shall not affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section, sentence, clause
or phrase of this ordinance.

CAM104300. 18X/FO008. 50000 -41 -



Section 15. Copies of the 1994 editions of the Uniform Building Code, the Uniform Fire
Code, the Uniform Mechanical Code and the Washington Administrative Code chapters 51-26, 51-30,
51-32, 51-34 and 51-35, as adopted by reference in this ordinance, are hereby filed with this ordinance
with the City Clerk.

Section 16. Effective Date. This ordinance shall take effect and be in full force on June
30, 1995. Publication of an approved summary consisting of the title shall be provided by the City
Clerk in the City of Gig Harbor newspaper of record.

APPROVED:

Gretchen A. Wilbert, Mayor
ATTEST/AUTHENTICATED:

Mark E. Hoppen, City Administrator

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
OFFICE OF THE CITY ATTORNEY:

BY

FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK: 6/12/95
PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL:
PUBLISHED:

EFFECTIVE DATE:

ORDINANCE NO.

CAML04800. 1SX/FO008. 950000 -42 -



City of Gig Harbor. The “Muritime City.”
3105 JUDSON STREET

GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON 98335
(206) 851-8136

TO: COUNCILMEMBERS, AND RAY MORE, PLANNING DIRECTOR

FROM: MAYOR GRETCHEN WILBER

SUBJECT: REAPPOINTMENT OF THE A MALICH MUELLER TO THE
PLANNING COMMISSION

DATE: JUNE 19, 1995

INTRODUCTION

Theresa Malich Mueller has served the city well as a member of the Planning Commission and has
consented to a reappointment to a second term. A term is for six years .

RECOMMENDATION
Reappointment of Theresa Malich Mueller to the Gig Harbor Planning Commission.







City of Gig Harbor. The “Maritime City.”

3105 JUDSON STREET
GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON 98335
(206) 851-8136
TO: MAYOR WILBERT, CITY COUNCIL 1
FROM: MARK HOPPEN, CITY ADMINISTRATOR * /¥ 2

SUBJECT: WESTSIDE PROFESSIONAL PARK SEWER REQUEST
DATE: JUNE 19, 1995

INFORMATION/BACKGROUND

Mr. Arnie Matthaei and Mr. Ken Kirk are requesting 6.45 ERUs of sewer capacity for six
buildings on their proposed business park site on Olympic Drive N.W. Buildings on the site
range in size from 2,560 sfto 6,400 sf. The estimated consumption rate based on existing data,
as approved by the City Engineer, is 1489.95 gallons per day., A three year commitment of
sewer capacity at 15% results in a capacity commitment payment of $1630.24. This property has
been assessed for ULID #2, as indicated in the letter from the applicants.

The site has completed Pierce County Hearings Examiner review (both the initial review, a
reconsideration, and the final decision). Both City of Gig Har bor Public Works and Planning
Departments report that the Westside Professional Park site plan is in substantial compliance
with City of Gig Harbor public works and land use standards.

A complete packet of findings, conclusions, and decisions relating to this project is in the yellow
folder in the Council in-basket.

POLICY CONSIDERATIONS

Grants of sewer for stmilar development have been granted to the nearby HIFIC Center, also a
participant in ULID #2. This area is not served by city water. As per GHMC 13.32.060 (C), "the
connection fee will be adjusted after the first year of operation of the establishment to reflect
actual flow usage in the event the flows were underestimated.”

FISCAL CONSIDERATIONS

Extensions to the ULID #2 service area, fiscally speaking, have the same effect on the city as any
outside extension which connects into ULID #1. The 1.5 outside multiplier on the sewer rate is
in effect.

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends the extension of 6.45 ERUs of sewer to Mr, Kirk and Mr. Matthai for the
Westside Professional Park.




WESTSIDE PROFESSICNAL PARK
GIG HARBOR, WA 98335

Mr. Mark Hoppen
P. 0. Box 145
Gig Harhor, WA 98335

Mr. Hoppen:

We hereby request approval to sign a contract with Gig Harbor for
6.45 ERU's for the Westside Professional Park on Olympic Drive.

This project has been through the PAC and referred to Pierce County
by our Engineering and Survey firm.

The Pierce County Public Works and Utilities Department cannot
approve the proposed formal plat prior to written confirmation
from the City of Gig Harbor, stating that all lots within the plat
and all requirements necessary to provide sewer service are satis-
fied.

In anticipating the need for sewers, we granted the City a 20 foot
easement, approximately 1200 feet lony, for sewers. Subseguent to
this, the sewer lines were installied and are in place.

In addition, we are participating in LID #99902-1028 for an initial
amount of $23,913.43. To date, we have paid, in a timely manner,
$18,333.99 including interest at 8.5%, leaving a princiapl balance
of $13,664.83.

Until such time as we receive the Sewer Availability Letter from the
City, we cannot proceed further toward obtaining County Approval.

Your favorable acticn at the earliest possible time will be appre-

Sincerely,

ciated.
Vs,
T

Arnold S. Matthaei

Kenneth J. Kirk Jr. arnold S. Matthaeil
1410 Cascade Place 6883 Starboard Lane
Gig Harbor, WA 98332 Gig Harbor, WA 98335
Res. 851-2004 Res. 851-3612

Off 851-9134



Bear Launcn

i)

..wf_m

r=

N L e

j

e

W

4

VALLEY—~— DR -

C"CRESCEN

LURT S |

See Hap 2 on feverss i
side for mofe detait of 1
Gig Harbor Pepinsula -




AVE. L]

35Th

I 3 7] -
t) «E“ L. _
ey N 120 unit Apartment House
e =
Q
) i
o
..... e | ?:"H
Lol
u LY R slr 343 1 oy 31z
oy b "
" (LY au yid 1 il a3z
> . p
.
LNT-N

HONTRERR

i | BURTCN

28 Aty

%

el Rt R |

\ Parker Paint

. Sleaners

tG, H. Chev

TR

LE ]

AL

%

F Fi : Harbor Tires

g JE&EEEE {
i i Bridgeway Realty

"Apartments ; I
et p———- R
f I
! ! L ‘Frisco Freeze
o [ _________ 4. e h;'_ - .

"E F | Kentucky Fried

H e —— R
Dlympic Plaza

. .
a
e “ ] Harbor Dell
Xey Bank
o b ‘safeway
Spot. Realkty

LT E
Washington Mutual

Harbor Plaza §hopping

2049
T"Bag n save
“’:“"‘" Ernst plus variety of
e ] other shops .
o 2 iRl
o Lon fud | :
s |
g N ..
:'_ J ‘Sea~First Bank
. AL JET | . B
’ SWI7 T2IN R2E



}6"’3 $"I Bz ,

The REVISED Preumlnarv Plat of .+ -

Westside

Professional
- Park

A Commercial Subdivision !

-

A Portion of the Southwest Quarter of Section 17, Tewaship 21 North, Range 2 East WM.

SITE DATA

WATER:Stroh's Water Company

SEWER: City of Gig Harbor

POWER: Peninsula Light Company

PHONE: Telephone Utilities of WA

ZONING: Residential Environment

PAVEMENTS: 34.587 sf (25%)

PARKING: 70 spaces (65 required) !

TRUCTURES: 18,496 sf (13%) ,

USEABLE FLOOR AREA: (Office = 25,792 sf !

TOTAL COVERAGE: 33,083 sf (38%) X

OPEN SPACE: 85,872 sf/ 1.97 acres {62%) ¢

TOTAL SITE: 3.19 acres (138,935 sf) :
1
!
H

[

arncoe
TELE

A e =3

I A
-y

-—— 4%
25' Open Space

[} -LL

LOT DATA .
Lot 1-26,831sf(2,560sf0Qffices)y  §y  — — — 7
Lot 2 - 23,527 sf (5,632 sf Offices)
Lot 3 - 24,113 sf {3,200s{ Qffices)
Lot 4-21,149 sf {4,000 sf Offices)
Lot B - 21,920 sf (4,000 sf Offices)
Lot 6 - 20,857 sf (6,400sf Offices) Ritchey

OWNER/DEVELOPER NORTH
Arnie Matthaei/Ken Kirk

3118 Harborview Drive e - — 3
Gig Harbor, WA 98335 o 31 S8 75 100
851-9134 NOT to Scale

1ud, 70
—_————
PR | e | _[_' -
3100 o .
e
=
! 3
- l_l A=}
-

T e

-
-
&
-

wer Expement —‘_ EEOT o =
’i
=
-
Grrike
4000 f
1 Fiear

141.00

HLx
ey S e et | ———

25' Opep Sprc

—
o

SURVEYOR CERTIFICATE

1 hereby certify that this preliminary plat was prepared in

sccordance with the requirements of RCW 58.17 and the
Pierce County Subdivigion Code,

McCormick

0 Open Spale ~-loc e -~
Prricis
A0d o
4 e

l

|

l

-

K
L

City of Gig (larbor 207 Sanlisry 8

Thomas L. Xerth; PLS #16628 Date

TLE Land Surveyors
1508 Eagt Floneesr; Suite € SEAL
Puyallup, WA 98371 531.5584

ca

-

Llgal=t]

] Flew

Subdivision Development & Design, Inc.
3505 Grandview Street

Gig Harbor, WA 98332 851-6451

» |

Q

I<

S

1]

IYEET)
———p iy — gt ingy

...
el
»

280 ="




g
‘:1_5;’ HALDING gﬂ "

¥
*

[ -td."‘,:.{..l.-‘._sra P4 o il B D

=, iRt

OLYMPIC DRIVE

E Ll

comee BT VAT 70 Nse WEIENTD M T e e

T v aari ATom 70 it = EL . it Ko S 3 e B e e} rd
L e 4 i P e [ ey | g ¢ Sam frlinmg=iary X
AT oREE reerac e e e Py,

TVEREATIN TR SuMi BEME BECRAWOV TREUM
1 it T i P s s

st P Gt ot | 8
L M

o ®
|
!
i
1
i

R b ar e L b— T s w
" s oy Sy T T b
et TR N ; : fan & 2 :
P v el

" sehematic design

1 ANDSCAPE PLAK
O ermas PROFESSIONAL PARIK







L3998 1@IG8 FROM THORRTON LAND SURY 0 - &5171%= PO

m}m 0 TRENT, P, E
o Director .-

' Ve the propoéed formal plat piior to receipt G ¥titien -
-Irom the C1ty of Glg Harbo“ wh:ch staxes thaz eﬂhﬁ;r alt lots mthm.iﬁns plat‘-are currentlyg'_'

‘ Adminis'tra'ﬁve Senncas :




CITY OF G!G HARBOR - UTILITIES SERVICE APPLICATION

Application No. ,ParcelNo. _02:20-17-3- 0%5  Date 5 |
iestside yo (Casionad Davi ‘ .
Applicant _ 4 ne L/hab%ﬁ@ 2 Ken Kipk ,Phone# __ §S/-36/2-

Mailing Address %82 Stinbeoued éa,nL
STORM WATER CALCULATION:

Impervious Area (Sq.Ft.) Calculation Units "
Connection/Service ADDRESS OR LOCATION: Olympic. Dy
Subdivision , Lot No. !

Date of Hook-Up , Meter No. , Size , Rate
Account No, , Meter Location
WATER SYSTEM HOOK-UP & METER INSTALLATION CHARGES:
_ Meter Capacity Hook-Up Fee Hook-Up Fee Meter Total
{X) Size Factor{s) | (Inside City Limits) (Outside City) Charge Fees
' 314" 1 $1,185.00 $1,777.50 $300.00 $
1" 1.6 $1,970.00 $2.955.00 $350.00 $
1-1/2" 3.33 $3,930.00 $5.805.00 )5 $
2" 5.33 $6,290.00 $9,435.00 )% $
Over2" | (3) (3)$ )% (3)$ $

WATER SYSTEM HOOK-UP & METER INSTALLATION CHARGE: $

OTHER CHARGES: (See Note 2)

Street Boring $10.00 / Foot
Open Street Cut $20.00/Foot
Refundable As-Built Plan Deposit

B 12 |8 |2 |

Notes: (1} if project Is outside the city limits, the hook-up fee is (1 5} times that shown above.
(2) Time & Material Plus 10%
@) Negotlable




BASIC SEWER SYSTEM CONNECTION FEE:

ll Zone A Zone B, C, D Other # OfERUS * Total Fee "
|| $685.00 $ 1,685.00 $2,365.00 $ 00

* Equivlaent Residential Unit Calculation for non-residential service:

Qﬁ_;g{g: Spggg_f_ ( ERU's per 5.U; e ho Fesne) X ( }= é;‘/\S
Class of Service Conversion rate for appropriate unit (sq. f., seats, students, efe.}  Number of units Equivalent ERU's

SPECIAL CHARGES:

Check Type of Fee (1) Fee
X)
Encroachment Permit Application & Fee $ 15.00
Sewer Stub Inspection Fee $ 125.00
House Stub Inspection Fee {$25 in city / $37.50 ouf) 3
As-Built Plans Deposit {Refundable) $150.00
Late Comers Agreement Fee $

Mote: {1) Single Family Residence only (See Public Works Depariment for Multi-Family and Commercial)

TOTAL SEWER SYSTEM FEES PAID: $ 1, o8 _ 25

TOTAL FEES PAID WITH THIS APPLICATION: $

Application is hereby made by the undersigned property owner or his agent for all water andfor sewer service required or used for
any purpose at the above property address for which | agree to pay in advance and In accordance with existing erdinances and regulations of
the ¢lty. Following estimated charges, the exact charges will be determined and are payable immediately upon completion of the instalfation.

I further agree that all rates and charges for water, spwer andfor storm service to the above property shall be paild in accordance
with the existing ordinances and regulations of the city or any ordlmances or regulations adopted hereafter, | agree to comply with the water,
sewer and storm drainage service existing ordinances/regulations of the city or any such erdinances/reguiations adopted hereafter.

1 understand that ihe city will use all reasanable effort to maintain ininterrupted service, but reserves the right to terminate the water
andfor sewer service at any time without notice for repairs, extensions, non payment of rates or any other appropriale reason and assumes no
liability for any damage as a result of interruption of service from any cause whatsocever.

| understand that the city shall maintain ewnership in such water meters instalied by the city and the city shall be respensible for
providing reasonable and normal maintenance to such meters, Damage to meters, baxes, and fittings will be repaired by the city’s public
works department. The cost of such repair work shall be berne by the contractor or the ewner of the property.

TO BE COMPLETED BY STAFF ONLY:

ﬁeceipted By "

|

Receipt No. Fees Paid

REVIEWED BY:
Building P.W Director P.W. Supervisor Utility

S14/95 F N\USERS\STEVEVFORMSHOOK-UP 952




CITY UF GIG HARBOK

3105 JUDSON STREET, GIG HARBOR, WA 98335
(Tromat d

‘///)7[%/:())';

TREASURER'S RECEIPT

32032

Mo 12,75

teon M i e

T FOR {/ OATE
¥pepT. {B/susl ELEM | oB DESCRIPTION __AMOUNT
Hi | /el [e0_ |2

oy

& )

BT ST T Sy

PRI e

LTI PP e




WHEN RECORDED RETURN TO:
City of Gig Harbor

Administrative Assistant

3105 Judson Street

Gig Harbor, WA 9833%

UTILITY EXTENSION, CAPACITY AGREEMENT
AND AGREEMENT WAIVING RIGHT TO PROTEST LID

THIS AGREEMENT is entered into on this day of 1995, between the City
of Gig Harbor, Washington, hereinafter referred to as the "City", and _Arnie Matthai and Ken
Kirk , hereinafter referred to as "the Owner".

WHEREAS, the Owner is the owner of certain real property located in Pierce County which
is legally described as set forth in Exhibit "A" attached hereto and incorporated herein by this
reference as though set forth in full, and

WHEREAS, the Owner’s property is not currently within the City limits of the City, and

WHEREAS, the Owner desires to connect to the City water and sewer utility system,
hereinafter referred to as "the utility," and is willing to allow connection only upon certain terms
and conditions in accordance with Title 13 of the Gig Harbor Municipal code, as now enacted
or hereinafter amended, NOW, THEREFORE,

FOR AND IN CONSIDERATION OF the mutual benefits and conditions hereinafter
contained, the parties agree as follows:

1.  Warranty of Title. The Owner warrants that he/she is the Owner of the property
described in Exhibit "A" and is authorized to enter into this Agreement.

2. Extension Authorized. The City hereby authorizes the Qwner to extend service to
Owner’s property from the existing utility line which parallels _ Olympic Drive NW _(street
or right-of-way) at the following location:

Olympic Drive NW

3. Costs. Owner will pay all costs of designing, engineering and constructing the extension.
All construction shall be done to City standards and according to plans approved by the City’s
Public Works Director. Any and all costs incurred by the City in reviewing plans and inspecting
construction shall be paid for by the Owner.

4. Sewer Capacity Commitment. The City agrees to provide to the Owner sewer utility
service and hereby reserves to the Owner the right to discharge to the City’s sewerage system
(645 ERUs) 1489.95 _ gallons per day average flow. These capacity rights are allocated
only to the Owner’s system as herein described. Any addition to this system must first be
approved by the City. Capacity rights acquired by the Owner pursuant to this agreement shall
not constitute ownership by the Owner of any facilities comprising the City sewerage system.




The City agrees to reserve to the Owner this capacity for a period of _36 months ending on

June 22. 1998 . provided this agreement is signed and payment for sewer capacity is
commitment received within 45 days after City Council approval of extending sewer capacity to
the Owner’s property. Sewer capacity shall not be committed beyond a three year period.

5. Capacity Commitment Payment. The Owner agrees to pay the City the sum of _$ 1630.24
to reserve the above specified time in accordance with the schedule set forth below.

Commitment period Percent (%) of Connection Fee
One year Five percent ( 5%)
Two year Ten percent (10%)

In no event, however, shall the Owner pay the City less than five hundred dollars ($500) for
commitment for sewer reserve capacity. In the event the Owner has not made connection to the
City’s utility system by the date set forth above, such capacity commitment shall expire and the
Owner shall forfeit one hundred percent (100%) of this capacity commitment payment to cover
the City’s administrative and related expenses.

In the event the Pierce County Boundary Review Board should not approve extension of the
City’s sewer system prior to the extension of the commitment period, the Owner shall be entitled
to a full refund (without interest) from the City of the capacity agreement.

6. Extension of Commitment Period. In the event the Owner chooses to permanently
reserve sewer capacity by paying the entire connection fee for the number of equivalent
residential units desired to be reserved before the expiration date set forth above, the Owner shall
be responsible for paying each year for the sewer utility system’s depreciation based on the
following formula: (Owner’s reserved capacity divided by the total plant capacity times the
annual budgeted depreciation of the sewer facilities.)

7. Permits - Easements. Owner shall secure and obtain, at Owner’s sole cost and expense
any necessary permits, easements and licenses to construct the extension, including, but not
limited to, all necessary easements, excavation permits, street use permits, or other permits
required by state, county and city governmental departments including the Pierce County Public
Works Department, Pierce County Environmental Health Department, State Department of
Ecology, Pierce County Boundary Review Board, and City of Gig Harbor Public Works
Department.

8. Turn Over of Capital Facilities. If the extension of utility service to Owner’s property
involves the construction of water or sewer main lines, pump stations, wells, and/or other city
required capital facilities, the Owner agrees to turn over and dedicate such facilities to the City,
at no cost, upon the completion of construction and approval and acceptance of the same by the
City. As a prerequisite to such turn over and acceptance, the Owner will furnish to the City the
following: '




A. As built plans or drawings in a form acceptable to the City Public Works
Department;

B. Any necessary ecasements, permits or licenses for the continued operation,
maintenance, repair or reconstruction of such facilities by the City, in a form
approved by the City Attorney;

C. A bill of sale in a form approved by the City Attorney; and

D. A bond or other suitable security in a form approved by the City Attorney and in an
amount approved by the City Public Works Director, ensuring that the facilities will
remain free from defects in workmanship and materials for a period of __ 2 year(s).

9. Connection Charges. The Owner agrees to pay the connection 'charges, in addition to any
costs of construction as a condition of connecting to the City utility system at the rate schedules
applicable at the time the Owner requests to actually connect his property to the system. Any
commitment payment that has not been forfeited shall be applied to the City’s connection charges.
Should the Owner not initially connect 100% of the Sewer Capacity Commitment, the Capacity
Commitment payment shall be credited on a pro-rated percentage basis to the connection charges
as they are levied.

10. Service Charges. [n addition to the charges for connection, the Owner agrees to pay for
utility service rendered according to the rates for services applicable to properties outside the city
limits as such rates exist, which is presently at 150% the rate charged to customers inside city
limits, or as they may be hereafter amended or modified.

11. Annexation. Owner understands that annexation of the property described on Exhibit
"A" to the City will result in the following consequences:

A. Pierce County ordinances, resolutions, rules and regulations will cease to apply to
the property upon the effective date of annexation;

B. City of Gig Harbor ordinances, resolutions, rules and regulations will begin to apply
to the property upon the effective date of annexation;

C. Govermnmental services, such as police, fire and utility service, will be provided to the
property by the City of Gig Harbor upon the effective date of annexation;

D. The property may be required to assume all or any portion of the existing City of
Gig Harbor indebtedness, and property tax rates and assessments applicable to the
property may be different from those applicable prior to the effective date of
annexation;

E. Zoning and land use regulations applicable to the property after annexation may be
different from those applicable to the property prior to annexation; and



F. Al or any portion of the property may be annexed and the property may be annexed
in conjunction with, or at the same time as, other property in the vicinity.

With full knowledge and understanding of these consequences of annexation and with full
knowledge and understanding of Owner’s decision to forego opposition to annexation of the
property to the City of Gig Harbor, Owner agrees to sign a petition for annexation to the City
of the property described on Exhibit A as provided in RCW 35.14.120, as it now exists or as it
may hereafter be amended, at such time as the Owner is requested by the City to do so. The
Owner also agrees and appoints the Mayor of the City as Owner’s attorney-in-fact to execute an
annexation petition on Owner’s behalf in the event that Owner shall fail or refuse to do so and
agrees that such signature shall constitute full authority from the Owner for annexation as if
Owner had signed the petition himself. Owner further agrees not to litigate, challenge or in any
manner contest, annexation to the City. This Agreement shall be deemed to be continuing, and
if Owner’s property is not annexed for whatever reason, including a decision by the City not to
annex, Owner agrees to sign any and all subsequent petitions for annexations. In the event that
any property described on Exhibit "A" is subdivided into smaller lots, the purchasers of each
subdivided lot shall be bound by the provisions of this paragraph.

12. Land Use. The Owner agrees that any development or redevelopment of the property
described on Exhibit "A" shall meet the following conditions after execution of Agreement:

A. The use of the property will be restricted to uses allowed in the following City
zoning district at the time of development or redevelopment. (Check One}):

Single Family Residential Multipie Family Residential
Commercial Industrial
X Business

B. The development or redevelopment shall comply with all requirements of the City
Comprehensive Land Use Plan, Zoning Code, Building Regulations, and City Public
Works Standards for similar zoned development or redevelopment in effect in the
City at the time of such development or redevelopment. The intent of this section
is that future annexation of the property to the City of Gig Harbor shall result in a
development which does conform to City standards.

13, Liens. The Owner understands and agrees that delinquent payments under this
agreement shall constitute a lien upon the above described property. If the extension is for sewer
service, the lien shall be as provided in RCW 35.67.200, and shall be enforced in accordance with
RCW 35.67.220 through RCW 35.67.280, all as now enacted or hereafter amended. If the
extension is for water service, the lien shall be as provided in RCW 35.21.290 and enforced as
provided in RCW 35.21.300, all as currently enacted or hereafter amended.

14. Termination for Non-Compliance. In the event Owner fails to comply with any ferm
or condition of this Agreement, the City shall have the right to terminate utility service to the
Owner’s property in addition to any other remedies available to it.




15. Waiver of Right to Protest LID. Owner acknowledges that the entire property legally
described in Exhibit "A" would be specially benefited by the following improvements to the utility

(specify):

Owner agrees to sign a petition for the formation of an LID or ULID for the specified improvements
at such time as one is circulated and Owner hereby appoints the Mayor of the City as his
attorney-in-fact to sign such a petition in the event Owner fails or refuses to do so.

With full understanding of Owmer's right to protest formation of an LID or ULID to construct such
improvements pursuant to RCW 35.43.180, Owner agrees to participate in any such LID or ULID
and to waive his right to protest formation of the same. Owner shall retain the right to contest the
method of calculating any assessment and the amount thereof, and shall further retain the right to
appeal the decision of the City Council affirming the final assessment roll to the superior court,
Notwithstanding any other provisions of this Agreement, this waiver of the right to protest shall only
be valid for a period of ten (10) years from the date this Agreement is signed by the Owner.

16. Specific Enforcement. In addition to any other remedy provided by law or this Agreement,
the terms of this Agreement may be specifically enforced by a court of competent jurisdiction.

17. Covenant. This agreement shall be recorded with the Pierce County Auditor and shall
constitute a covenant running with the land described on Exhibit "A", and shall be binding on the
Owner, his/her heirs, successors and assigns. All costs of recording this Agreement with the Pierce
County Auditor shall be borne by the Owner.

18. Attorney's Fees. In any suit or action seeking to enforce any provision of this Agreement,

the prevailing party shall be entitled to reasonable attomey's fees and costs, in addition to any other
remedy provided by law or this agreement.

DATED this ____ ___ dayof , 1695,

CITY OF GIG HARBOR

Mayor Gretchen Wilbert




ATTEST/AUTHENTICATED:

City Clerk, Mark Hoppen

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
OFFICE OF THE CITY ATTORNEY:




STATE OF WASHINGTON )
} ss.
COUNTY OF PIERCE )

On this _. day of . 1994, before me personally appeared _____
, to me known to be the individual described in and who executed the foregoing
and acknowledged that ______ signed the same as his free and voluntary act and deed, for the uses
and purposed therein mentioned.

IN WITNESS THEREQF, 1 have hereto set my hand and affixed by official seal the day and
year first above written.

NOTARY PUBLIC for the State
of Washington, residing at

My commission expires

STATE OF WASHINGTON
ss:

o

COUNTY OF PIERCE

On this day of , 1994, before me personally appeared Mayor and
City Clerk of the municipal corporation described in and that executed the within and foregoing
instrument, and acknowledged said instrument to be the free and voluntary act and deed of said
municipal corporation, for the uses and purposes therein mentioned, and on oath stated that he/she
was authorized to execute said instrument.

IN WITNESS THEREOF, I have hereto set my hand and affixed by official seal the day and
year first above written.

NOTARY PUBLIC for the State
of Washington, residing at

My commission expires



City of Gig Harbor. The “Maritime City.”

3105 JUDSON STREET
GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON 98335
(206) 851-8136
TO: MAYOR WILBERT, CITY COUNCIL Y 774
FROM: MARK HOPPEN, CITY ADMINISTRATOR 4

SUBJECT: SURVEYING CONTRACT
DATE: JUNE 20, 1995

INFORMATION/BACKGROUND

The city is attempting to specifically define a feasible route to connect the Seacliff area to
Peacock Hill Road. Subject the determination of the route, three of the four large parcels
affected have agreed to discuss the negotiation of an easement. Public Works Director Ben
Yazici has provided parameters for the road lay-out to Thornton Land Surveying.

POLICY CONSIDERATIONS
This contract is consistent with 1995 Administrative Objective #9: "Acquire easement for a
connecting corridor from 112th Street {o Crescent Valley Drive."

FISCAL CONSIDERATIONS
The contract is capped at $3400, although Thomton Land Surveying will work hourly., The
actual cost will probably be less.

RECOMMENDATION
Staff recommends approval of this contract.




PROPOSAL AND AGREEMENT FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

THORNTON LAND SURVEYING, INC. o
P.0. BOX 249

GIG HARBOR, WA. 08335-8249
PHONE: 206-858-81@6 / FAX: 206-858-7466

Date:_ June 14, 1995 Job No. ‘é

Client and/or Agent:

Citv of Gig Harbor Phona: Home:
P.O. Box 145 Mobile:
Gig Harboxr, WA. 88335 Work:_851-8136
Attn: Mark Hoppen Pager:

Ben Yazici: 851-8145
In caonsideration of the mutual obligations of the parties hereto, it is
agread by and between the parties that, the following work is to be done:

: Li Tt .
to 112th St. NW in the NEY% NEX af 32-22_-2FE acrass parcels
. 2-080Q /. 2-079 72-089 /2.090

It is agreed that the estimated cost of the work to be dane will be

$340C.00 , With a retainer of $_17200.00 down, and tha balance dua upon

completion,

cont I e 4 i al ¢ witheu b4 thorizat

SECTION _32 TOWNSHIP __2o5n _ RANGE IE

HOURLY RATES FOR PROFESSIDNAL SERVICES

LICENSED SURVEYOR § 65.09 AUTOCADD & DRAFTS PERSON $ 5¢.060
2 MAN CREW $100.00 : 3 MAN CREW $125.00
SECRETARIAL SERVICES $ 25.69 SURVEY TECHNICIAN $ 55.08

SURVEY SUPPORT SERVICES ¢ 3¢.80

Maps and/or descriptions of work will not be released, or recorded, untii the
balance of the survey cost is paid in full, unless ctherwise arranged for in
advance. It is expressly understood that the above information is correct, and
that the weork to be done, as set out above, is hereby authorized.

4
Note: Please allow up to 2 weeks to start the project, upon our receipt
of this signed contract, and the retainer returned.

Greg Bauer
Date: June 14, 1995

on Land Surveying, Inc.
ACCEPTED AND APPROVED BY:

Date:

OWNER/AGENT

Date:

OWNER/AGENT

c:\pwilettersiwkorder



Citv of Gig Harbor. The “Maritime Citv.”
3105 JUDSON STREET

GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON 98335
(206) 851.8136

TO: COUNCILMEMBERS ;
FROM: MAYOR GRETCHEN WILBER
SUBJECT: RESOLUTION OPPOSING ACCEPTANCE OF SPENT NUCLEAR FUEL

DATE: JUNE 21, 1995

INTRODUCTION

A policy is currently being proposed jointly by the United States Department of Energy and United
States Department of State to accept and manage spent nuclear fuel from foreign research reactors
by shipment through the Port of Tacoma, Washington.

Pierce County Council has passed Resolution R95-113 opposing the transport of these spent fuels
through the Port of Tacoma and has asked for support from other cities and towns in Pierce County
in this effort. Attached is a resolution restating the issues and concerns for your consideration.

RECOMMENDATION
Approval of the attached resolution as presented.




CITY OF GIG HARBOR
RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR,
WASHINGTON, EXPRESSING STRONG OPPOSITION TO THE ADOPTION OF A
POLICY, BEING PROPOSED JOINTLY BY THE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF
ENERGY AND UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF STATE, TO ACCEPT AND
MANAGE SPENT NUCLEAR FUEL FROM FOREIGN RESEARCH REACTORS BY
SHIPMENT THROUGH THE PORT OF TACOMA, WASHINGTON.

WHEREAS, the United States Department of Energy and the United States Department of
State are jointly proposing to adopt a policy to manage spent nuclear fuel from foreign research
reactors; and

WHEREAS, nuclear fuel containing vranium enriched in the United Stotes of America would
be covered by this policy; and

WHEREAS, the purpose of this policy is to promeote United States nuclear weapons
nonproliferation policy objectives, specifically seeking to reduce highly enriched uranium from
civilian commerce, and

WHEREAS, the environmental effects and policy considerations of three management
alternative approaches for implementation of the proposed policy and assessed; and

WHEREAS, alternative number one would be the acceptance and management of the spent
nuclear fuel by the Department of Energy in the United States; and

WHEREAS, under alternative number one the spent nuclear fuel will be shipped by ocean-
going vessels from foreign countries to the United States of America; and

WHEREAS, the City of Gig Harbor is a municipality in the County of Pierce and shares
waters in close geographic proximity to the Port of Tacoma; and

WHEREAS, the Port of Tacoma is considered one of ten ports through which the shipment
of spent nuclear fuels would occur, and

WHEREAS, the Draft Environmental Impact Statement (DEIS) was prepared to address the
Proposed Nuclear Weapons Nonproliferation Policy Concerning Foreign Research Reactor Spent
Nuclear Fuel; and

A the DEIS has used outdated information about the Port of Tacoma, its terminals, its
operations, and the surrounding area;

B. the DEIS did not consider the deep-water depth in the Puget Sound area, which will



cause substantial problems in recovery of nuclear fuel shipping containers in case of
accident, especially considering the limited integrity standard for containers
pertaining to water;

C. the DEIS fully ignored the harm which can be caused to the population and
environment of the area in case of an explosion and fire aboard a vessel navigating
Puget Sound;

D. the DEIS did not recognize the status of Commencement Bay as a superfund site, the
stigma attached to this designation, and the expansion of this stigma by Alternative
Number One;

E. the DEIS ignored the significant cleanup effort by the Port of Tacoma, the City of
Tacoma, the industries in Commencement Bay, and the associated crippling business
interruption issues;

F, the DEIS stated that part of this material would be of interes* to unfiiendly nations
and/or terrorists, and yet did not provide adequate risk and consequence information
of a compete, explosive breach of the nuclear fuel by disgruntled persons or
terrorists;

G. the DEIS did not consider the security aspect of these shipments through the Port of
Tacoma, the City of Tacoma, Pierce County, and the State of Washington;

H. the DEIS did not adequately address the life cycle costs or benefits and risks of the
proposed alternatives;

L. the DEIS fully ignored the fairness and equity issues of selecting the smaller ports
in lower population areas after implying the risks were virtually inconsequential; and

WIHEREAS, the record for the safe operation and handling of nuclear materials in United
States Department of Energy regulated facilities is less than satisfactory, and there are facilities
owned and operated by the United States Government capable of receiving and handling this nuclear
material, and

WHEREAS, the United States House Budget Resclution eliminates the Umted States
Department of Energy thereby creating funding uncertainties, and

WHEREAS, the United States Department of Energy has failed to properly answer a
question in a meeting conducted by the Port of Tacoma, in Tacoma on the 22nd of May, 1995,
(reference Attachment 'A") pertaining to the effect of radiation in the environment should a shipping
cask be damaged during the handling process in the Port, or to respond in writing to that question
as promised and; NOW, THEREFORE,

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GIG HARBOR, WASHINGTON HEREBY
RESOLVES AS FOLLOWS:




Section 1. The City Council of Gig Harbor, Washington, strongly opposes adoption of a
policy, being proposed jointly by the United States Department of Energy and United States
Department of State, to accept and manage spent nuclear fuel from foreign research reactors by
shipment through the Port of Tacoma, Washington.

Section 2, Copies of this Resolution shall be transmitted to President Clinton, Vice
President Gore, the United States Department of Energy, the United States Department of State, the

Washington State Congressional delegation, the Washington State Legislature, the Office of the
Governor, the Pierce County Executive, the King County Council and Executive,

RESOLVED by the City Council this day of , 1995.

APPROVED:

Gretchen A. Wilbert, Mayor

ATTEST/AUTHENTICATED:

Mark E. Hoppen, City Administrator/Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM;
OFFICE OF THE CITY ATTORNEY:

BY:

FILED WITH THE CITY CLERK:  6/21/95
PASSED BY THE CITY COUNCIL:



ATTACHMENT 'A'

Seotile Office Woshington, D.C Office Board of Directors Executive Director
1305 Fourth Avenue washington, D.C. Representotiva: Mark Bloome, Chairman Garaid M, Pollst
Cobb Building. Suite 208 Honorable Don Bonker $haren Bloome, President
98101 clo APC Honorabie Don Bonkes,

Seaftie. ywashington 10 APCQ) Member of Congress, 1974-1980
{2063 382-1014 1155 2151 Streat MW, Suite 1000 Broce & ; QL. -
FAX (206) 382-1148 washington, D.C. 20036 Do Hive

(202) 778-1019 Helen Koppe

FAX. (202) 466-6002 Glenn Pasaall

HeartOfAmericaNorthwest

‘Advencing our region’s qually ot ife.! . . vie
*Fact Sheet and Testimony Tips for Citizens

regarding U.S. Department of Energy’s
Proposed Shipments Importing High-Level Nuclear Waste from
Foreign Research Reactors through Puget Sound or Portland

LAST PUBLIC HEARING

6:00 PM on Monday, June 19, 1995 at the Tacoma Public
Utilities Building, Auditorium, 3628 S. 35th Ave.
{on the corner of 35th and Union)

* Proposed shipments are "High-Level Nuclear Waste", extremely radioactive "spent nuclear fuel”.
USDOE avoids the term "High-Level Nuclear Waste" in the notices, ads and EIS for the hearing.

* Hearings are on the Draft EIS ( Environmental Impact Statement ) for a policy to return to the U.S.
for disposal the "spent nuciear fuel” from foreign ’research’ reactors in 41 nations.

* In 1986, a federal court barred the USDOE from importing these casks of spent fuel through the Ports
of Seattle or Tacoma unless an EIS was prepared considering all environmental and human health
impacts and reasonable alternatives; one key potential impact that USDOE never considered is the very
real potential for a shipboard fire on inland waters (i.e., Puget Sound or Elliott Bay ), which could
breach the casks and release a vast deadly cloud of radiation.

* The Seattle City Council has twice passed resolutions opposing such High-Level Nuclear Waste ship-
ments through Seattle { contact City Council Member Jane Noland, chalr Utilities Committee ), and
ILWU Locals 8 ( Portland ) and 19 ( Seattle ) have passed resolutions stating that they will refuse to
handle these High-Level Nuclear Waste shipments, which pose unacceptable exposure risks to workers.

* USDOE began taking waste from foreign reactors even before the EIS was issued. South Carolina took
USDOE to court over this violation of NEPA ( the federal law requiring the EIS ) for Belgium’s reactor
wastes. The proposed importation policy is based on a ¢laim that importing these nations’ wastes is a
nonproliferation policy decision. Belgium is hardly a nuclear weapons "proliferation” risk.

* Other nations from whom we will take waste under the proposed policy include Japan, Australia,
Canada, Sweden, Switzerland, Taiwan .... U.S. taxpayers will subsidize the importation and pay for the
disposal costs of these nuclear wastes, including bearing all costs for the reactor wastes from
“developing" nations. Thus, these countries will not bear the financial or environmental burdens of their
decisions to operate these nuclear reactors. '

* The USDOE is considering use of normal, regularly scheduled comumercial shipping lines for the
transport of the High Level Nuclear Waste casks through Puget Sound and Portland.

* Casks are allowed under U.S. regulations to emit 200 millirem per hour at the surface, the equivalent
to approximately 10 full body X-rays per hour. Longshoremen and the public will receive potentially
significant exposures if commercial freighters are used and waste casks are offloaded in Portland,
Tacoma or Seattle and trucked through city streets and highways to Hanford or INEL. Children stuck
in traffic alongside or behind such a waste shipment could receive a significant dose. No state or local
regulation of routes or hours for trucking the wastes is permitted by USDOE.

POl DT




* Up to 50% of some radioactive waste trucking firms’ trucks in Washington State have been cited for
major safety deficiencies when inspected at the state border. There is no such provision for inspecting
these proposed shipments before they move on our local streets.

* USDOE has never agreed to pay the costs for monitoring, training and equipping local emergency
responders at the Ports of Entry and along the trucking routes. The Seattle Fire Department is on record
regarding the high risk entailed if there is a shipboard fire. Local firefighters lack the necessary
radiation training and equupment to respond The costs of preparanon are very high. We must insist upon
USDOQE paying the full costs for training, equipment 2nd monitoring for local emergency responders if
" this program js aliowed to proceed, along with insisting on the use of military transport instead of

c ercial shipping and public ports and highways for transportation }.

* The shipping casks will not be inspected by the U.S. government until arrival at the Port of Entry.

* Shipping casks are designed to withstand a fire at 1,475 degrees F for a half hour. Shipboard fires,
especially on commercial freighters carrying numerous chemical and explosive cargoes, can easily exceed
this temperature for extended periods. In 1991, a ship fire at the Port of Seattle lasted over 24 hours and
reached temperatures of 2000 degrees F.

* In 1991, Marvin Resnikoff, PhD., calculated the consequences of a shipboard fire on inland waters
( i.e., Puget Sound or Elliott Bay ) for a ship carrying such Highly Enriched Uramium spent fuel as
envisioned in this policy, and utilizing the USDOE’s own models and computer codes:

"The results show serious contamination plumes extending over 60 miles downwind from a ship
accident, encompassing an area up to 900 square miles. The contamination levels are high enough
to require evacuation and decontamination. For areas up to one mile downwind from a ship accident,
the gamma radiation dose would be lethal to any person who remained in the contaminated area for
a year." _

* While the U.S. has required our nation’s nuclear reactors to expand storage capacity for spent fuel
rods or place the fuel rods in U.S. developed technology called "dry cask storage” ( which is far safer
for both storage and transportation ), the proposed USDOE policy fails to consider requiring the foreign
reactors, which USDOE claims are running out of storage space, to either "rerack” in a safe
configuration their fuel rods or to utilize commercially available U.S. technology. Instead, the USDOE
_proposes to simply, at U.S. taxpayer expense, import the waste through our communities and store it
at Hanford, INEL or Savannah River. The public should insist that the *Preferred’ Alternative in the EIS
- based_on the costs and risk data - should be at reactor storage and monitoring to ensure that fuel is not
diverted for extraction of the highly enriched uranium.

* Hanford is not an acceptable site for the storage of foreign reactors’ High-Level Nuclear Waste.
Hanford already has a leaking storage pool of High-Level Nuclear Waste fuel rods alongside the
Columbia River ( "K-Basins" ). USDOE is already failing to fully fund safe storage and.removal of K-
Basin’s wastes. USDOE NOT be allowed to increase the size of the facility planned for K-Basin's fuel
rods to accomodate the rest of the world’s waste. If the foreign fuel rods are brought to Hanford, we
can expect even greater delays in resolving the very high environmental and public health threat from
the existing "K Basin" fuel rods.

* Agreeing to take nuclear waste, at U.S. taxpayer expense, from many nations that are not nuclear
proliferation risks does not encourage those nations to utilize safe nuclear waste storage technology or
to internalize the environmental and financial costs of nuclear waste disposal into their nuciear programs.
The nonproliferation rationale does not even apply to the significant portion of the waste involved that
is Low Enriched Uranium, which is not usable m weapons.

Funding for this publication was provided by & Public Participation Grant from the Washington
State Department of Ecology. The Deparimment of Ecology has reviewed this malerial for
consistency with the purposes of the grant only. Funding by the Department does not consiitute
endorsement of opirtons, conclusions, or recornmendsfions expressed herein,



May 1995 Q

TACOMA-PIERCE COUNTY CHAMBER OF COMMERCE

Raescluticon
to the
Board of Directors

from the
Chair, Port=-Industrial Committee

SUBJECT: Importation of Spent Nuclear Fuel Through the Port of Tacoma

POLICY: The Chamber opposes the importation of spent nuclear fuel
through the Port of Tacoma ae not in the best interest of the region or
this community; social, safety and econcmic impacts must be weighed by
the U.sS. Department of Energy.

BACKGROUND: The naticn has embarked upon a program designed to lessen
the potential for proliferation of nuclear weapons. The U.S.
Department of Energy and U.S. Department of State are propo=ing a
relicy to manage gpent nuclear fuel that contains uranium enriched in
the U.s. but used in foreign research reactors. A draft environmental
impact statement examines the impacts associated with carrying out this
policy cbjective. That draft environmental impact statement is open to
written public comment until June 20, 1995,

The pelicy seeks to reclaim Highly Enriched Uranium (HEU) from the
civilian reactors of 41 countries., While the HEU will be replaced with
Low Enriched Uranium (LEU), HEU is capable of being processed into
weapons and LEU is not. This transfer is estimated to take 132 years and
involve an average of 5 shipmente of HEU per month.

Thigs is an anti-terrorist program. However, only about 4% of the
materials will come from countries of special interest for
non-proliferation. Much will come from countries not considered
proliferation threats (e.g. Japan, Canada, Switzerland) or already
non—threatening nuclear powers (e.g. France, Great Britain).

Once complete, this transfer would encourage a safer world. DOE
representatives have said there isg interest in similar programse with
China, Russia and Republic of Scuth Africa. These programs, once
implemented, would increase the frequency and/or duration of transfer
shipments.

A process has been followed which results in ten civilian and military
ports under consideration for through—-put of thesa shipments. Tacoma
and Seattle were placed on the original list for consideration but
Seattle has baen removed based on population count, according to
commente by U.S. Department of Energy representatives at a fact-finding
meeting sponsored by the Port of Tacoma May 22, 1995.

The benafits associated with movement of these containers is similar to
the movement of any carge.

950 PACIFIC AVENUE, SUTTE 200, PO BOX 1933, TACOMA, WA 98401
PHONE: 206-627-2175, FAX 206-587-7305

ACCREDIIED BY THE CHAMBER OF COMMERCE OF THE UNITED STATES



The following liabilities are anticipated:
1) The ILWU Local #23 has declared they will not handle this
cargo. Rs these shipments will ccme by regular commercial carrier,
other cargo will be affected. Potentially, cargos of adjacent
berthed ships might be impacted, thereby hampering the movement of
commercial cargos.
2) Shipment containers are highly secure and have been tested to
handle to all but exceptional circumstances. For instance,
containers can withstand fire temperatures of 1,450 degrees for 30
minutes. However, last year, a shipboard fire in Seattle's harbor
produced temperatures of 2,000 degrees for 24 hours. Intentional
breaching would seem to be the only other risk.
3) Almost all civilian commerce of nuclear materials is
anonymous, which greatly increases its security. However, the
result of this environmental impact statement's conclusion will
identify the transshipment point for nuclear materials of 19.2
short tons, thereby compromising security and may attract the
attention of terrorist groups.
4} Tervrorist groups don't have to steal and process nuclear
materials and make bombs to create nuclear incidents. Weither
Chernobyl nor Three Mile Iesland involved nuclear explosions.
5) There are no provisionse for funding or training nuclear hazmat
{hazardouy materials) teams locally. DOE representatives have
stated that any breach in shipment containers could be handled by
teams dispatched from Hanford. Funding cut-backs at Eanford
may adversely affect response times. There are no provisions or
funding for safety planning or training or exercises for local
respondents or adjacent worksites or populations. DOE
representatives say that any breaching c¢f a container will cause
less effecte than Cherncbyl.
6) Expoeing the Tacoma population to these risks is unnecessary.
Importation through the Port of TFacoma will invelve rail or truck
shipment to one or more of several storage sites. Whether by rail
or road, these shipments will go through Seattle or Portland.
Beginning importation in Taccma will just add to the numbers of
pecple exposed to any risk.
7) Peoples' unreasoning fears associated with nuclear energy is
expected to produce a stigma for whichever port's community is
anncunced as the transshipment point.
8) Rail lines north and south are nearing capacity. Considerations
on pairing nuclear containers with dangerous cargos will
exacerbate shipment and capacity problems. Additicnally, shipment
north will result in rail delays of about one hour due to
congestion in the Cascade Tunnel. A decision on expansion of
rail options through the Stampede Pass is still ahead.

Alternatives are evaluated in the envirommental impact statement and
should be considered for adoption.

IMPLEMENTATION: The Chamber has spcken at a fact-finding meeting held
by the Port of Taccma, peinting cut iesues to he examined. The final
opportunity to present a Chamber's policy recommendation for
consideration in the decision-making process, will be at a DOE
scheduled hearing in Tacoma June 19.



] WASHINGTON STATE LIGQUOR CONTROL BOARD
Lizense Diviston - 1025 . Unicn, P.C. Box 43075
Olympia, W4 98504-3075
(360) 664-0012

TO: MAYOR OF GIG HARBOR DATE: &/18/85

RE: NEW APPLICATION

ticense; G78044 - ZH County: 27 APPLICANTS:
Tradename: DOWN EAST RESTAURANT
Loc Addr: 53772 SOUNDVEIEW DR JECN, CATHERINE S
GIG HARBOR WA 98335 12-28-60 537-84-9176
JEON, JIN UK
Mail Addr: 5775 SOUNDVIEW DR 08-12-57 538-98-7850
GIG HARBOR WA ©B335-2041

Pn_one No.: 206-759-1782

Classes Applied For:
A Restaurant or dining place - Beer an premises
C Wine on premises

As required by RCW 66.24.010(8), you are notified that application has been made to the Washmgton
State Liquor Control Board for a license to conduct busmess. If return of this notice is not recerved in
this office within 20 DAYS from the date above, it will be assumed that you have no objection to the issuance
of the license. If additional time is reqnired you mnst submit 2 written request for an extension ofup
to 20 days. Axn extension of more than 20 days will be approved ounly under extraordinary circumstances.

L Doyouapprove of applicant 2 .. v ieetiee it ttiin it irnentiennrrisaiareraerienra s ‘%s I{%
2.Doyouapprove of location 7 . .. ... .. 1 [
3. If you disapprove and the Board contemplates issuing a license. do you want a hearing

before final actiom 18 EAKEI T . . o ottt ettt et e e e e e e e 1

If you have indicated disapproval of the applicant, location or both, please submit a statement of all facts
upion which snch objections arc based. '

ATE _ SIGNATURE OF EAYOR,CITY MANAGER,COUNTY COMMISSIONERS CR DESIGNEE

CO80045 L IPRIMS

L wam AR At et me e s e e m e rea b o mh e it ek e e e e o e 4 e em o






